TITUS COUNTY Page 1

ROAD MATERIALS & ROAD OILS, BID # 2023-09
11-Sep-23

Dates of Public Notice in Local Newspaper: August 12, 2023 & August 19, 2023

Deadline for Bids Delivered to County Auditor's Office: August 29,2023 at 9:00 AM

Date Bids Opened: August 29, 2023 at 9:30 AM

Bids Received, Date Received, Time Received, Method of Delivery
ROAD MATERIALS:

HE Spann & Co., Inc, August 23, 2023, 10:42 AM, Hand Delivered

RK Hall, LLC, August 23, 2023, 11:17 AM, Mailed

Seaton Construction, Inc, August 28, 2023, 10:12 AM, Hand Delivered
WM CCP Solutions, LLC, August 18, 2023, 11:30 AM, UPS

ROAD OILS:

Richard Drake Construction Company, LP, August 17, 2023, 2:40 PM, Federal Express
RK Hall, LLC, August 23, 2023, 11:17 AM, Mailed

Contract Effective Dates

This bid is scheduled to be presented for approval in Commissioners' Court on September 11, 2023.
It is for a 1 year contract with option to renew for 2 additional year upon agreement by vendor

and County. Bid is initially effective September 11, 2023 upon approval by Commissioners' Court.

FOB LOCATION & ADDRESS FOR PICK UP

HE Spann, 1173 US HWY 67 E, Mt. Pleasant, Texas

Seaton Construction, Yard Pick-Up in Cookville, Texas & Pitt Pick-Up in Hughes Springs, Texas
WM CCP Solutions, Welsh Generating Station, 7473 FM 1735, Pittsburg, Texas

RK Hall, 244 OK 147, Sawyer, OK 74756 for ROAD MATERIALS

RK Hall, Mt. Pleasant Plant, Mt. Pleasant, Texas for ROAD OILS

RK Hall, Greenville, Texas for High Performance Road Oil

Richard Drake, 221 CR 12530, Paris, Texas

HE Spann  RK Hall Seaton WM CCP R. Drake
NON COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT: YES YES YES YES YES
GENERAL LIABILITY INSURANCE: YES NO NO NO YES

Commissioners to determine the need for insurance.
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TITUS COUNTY

'DEADLINE: August 29 2023 at 9: 00 AM

|
-

ROAD MATERIALS ~ |BID #2023-09 R
T I R ! |
R I l | |
I R HE SPAFE ’ FUEl. ADJUSTMT HESPANN RKHALL SEATON WM CCP

- 'BASEPRICE | ~ FLYASH
- . W/0 | SURCHARGE TOTAL | DIRECT

| SURCHARGE | 8/18/2023 | 8/18/2023 N

|

SEAL COAT AGGREGATE -TY B /GR4- PRICE PER TON:

|
|
|
1

DELIVERED|  |$ 5900  $19.50HaulPrice |$ 5939 S 61.16 )
| At2%PADD=39 | ?
PICKEDUP No Bid 'S 40.00 |
FOB | LOCATION B - . Sawyer, OK | )
| |

P . ST : | I S
FVLVELI_BASIg i\ﬂl_ - TYPE A - PRICE PER TON ; :
FlyashRock Flex Base | | b |
Delivered ! ‘NoBid
Picked Up ] g D ' ! | '$ 10.00
FOB LOCATIC_)N D i | Welsh Plan
A 1 i _ Pittsburg
BottomAsh [ | - N
Delivered | 1 || |  NoBid |
Pickedup | | ] : | '$  6.00
FOB LOCATION | A Y | Welsh Planf
I | Pittsburg |
lili_@.ﬁ_AE—P—RI_C_E P_E_R TO_N_, Zﬁc_h fi;\_'\estone Base: i -
9?|i_\£r£ B “f _5?? 2785 |$15.60 Haul Price | $  28.16 ' o

“ | lat2%PADD=31 B
Picked Up | N $ 3350 -
FOBLOCATION = Mt.__gigqg;t _____ .
3inch Limestone Base, PerTon: , L .
Delivered | '$ 3085  $15.60HaulPrice ' $ 3116 .

T | at2%PADD=31 * N

P|cked Up - S 33.50 | |
FOB LOCATION Mt Pleasant ‘
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'HESPANN  FUELADJUSTMT  HESPANN RKHALL SEATON WM CCP

e e e e _.i

. BASEPRICE . FLASH
" _ W/O | SURCHARGE  TOTAL = DIRECT
(P SURCHARGE . 8/18/2023 s/1s/2023 . |
} I ey I |
Other Size pra— Base, Price Per ﬂf.{—'—"__ I B

T = t

SIZE: 1 3/4" Limestone Base | '

Delivered T 1s 3085 515 60 H Haul Prlce e [$ 3116
o e | at2%PADD=31 |
Picked Up 1 '$ 3350
FOBLOCATION | jo Pleasantf | - |

| F
— = el [ e —

11/2" Sandstone Base, TXDOT Type A, Grade 2or Equwalent, Price per Ton ;
Delivered | $ 3100 '$19.50 Haul Price | $  31.39 | 'S 33.16

- 2 ‘at 2% PADD=.39 ,
Picked Up | | '$ 3300 S 1200

e e s e —

FOB LOCATION Mt Pleasant | _ Sawyer,OK|

Other Size Sandstdné Base, T)(DOT Type A, Grade 2 or Equwalent Price per Ton:

SIZE: 13/4" Base - L I
Delivered 5 32 00 /$19.50 Haul Price :7'$_7” 32 39 $ 33. 60

| at 2% PADD=39 | ' | |
Plcked Up | i1 | _4 ~_ |NoBid $ 1250 | - E
FOB L LOCATION b Sawyer, OK|
FLEXBASE, CRUSHED IRON ORE GRAVEmI-CE_PER CUBICYARD: 1
PICKED UP AT THE PIT: 1 1 . |
Dehvered [T ___-_-__—________L - " No Bid B
Picked Up | I T 5000
FOB LOCATION | 1] R THughesW. |
] __ | __ ! o Sprlngs \
PICKED !L‘\_T,_Tﬂ? vaRo: N
Delivered . NoBd
Picked Up j ' ' 1 ]$%$ 3000
FOBLOCATION = o cookville |
_ |
WASHED PEA GRAVEL 'Qﬁ'i_o'ﬁﬁ?nicsben ToNn. ]
Delivered | | |$ 3092 $15.60HaulPrice | $  31.23 | f
T at2%PADD=31 - B
PickedUp | s maeol T
FOB _LQCATION Mt Pleasant | e
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FUEL SURCHARGE: Requested by HE Spann: N .
The cost of fuel will be based on the US Energy Information Administration Gulf Coast (PADD3)
gasolme and diesel retail prices located at www.eia. gov/dnav The initial fuel charge will be
based on the value as of August 18, 2023 which is the date closest to the initial advertising for these
[products. After August 18, 2023, the fuel charge will be adjusted up or down based on the -
information from this website. This website provides adjusted prices weekly on Monday.
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TITUSCOUNTY DEADLINE: August 29, 2023 at 9:00AM Pglof2
[ROAD OIL - BID #: 2023-09 - [ ]
1 | |
- ~ RICHARD | ‘ RK 1
- - DRAKE i j HALL ]

HOT OILSAND TYPE D ROCK 9% FIELD SAND 85%, AC 1.50IL 6% PRICE P PER TON:

Paris, Texas |

Delivered | s 104.80 | I 9500
Picked Up | . [ I 88.80 's 88.00 |
[FOB LOCATION & ADDRESS _ | 221CR12530 | Mt Pleasant Plant

T I |
t |

[ TYPE D COLD MIX(PI_ER_S'_I'ATE OF TEXAS SPECS) - PRICE PER TON:

Delivered | | E 106.80 | 'S 95.00

Paris, Texas

Picked Up | | s 90.80 | S 88.00
FOB LOCATION & ADDRESS | 221CR12530 | Mt. Pleasant Plant _

T

TYPE D HOT MIX: TYPE D ROCK 60% SCREENINGS 15%, FIELD SAND 20%, AC 64-22 5%,

PRICE PER '_T_ON |

Delivered | : S 113.90

] E 10200
Picked Up | | R $ 94.80 E 9500
FOB LOCATION & A[}_[_)BE§S ] | 221CR12530 ‘M. Pleasant Plant
r Paris, Texas

TYPE D HOT MIX, LAID DOWN - PRICE PER TON:

Delivered & Laid Down : 1 S 165.90 No Bid

[Minimum Tons, if required ; j 500 Tons | . No Bid

|
1
\

PLANT MIX SEAL, LAID DOWN AC OIL PG 64-22 WITH OIL CONTENT 6.2% TO 6.4%

AND 100% TYPE D AGGREGATE - PRICE PER TON:

Delivered & Laid Down ; No Bid i : No Bid

Minimum Tons, if required f ~ No Bid | - No Bid

|
|

TYPEF COLD MIX, 1. 50 olL- PRICE PER TON:

Delivered | L 'S 12190 NoBid | |
Pickedp | | S 105.90 [o L S S
FOB LOCATION & ADDRESS 221CR12530 |

{ " Paris, Texas
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RICHARD

~ DRAKE

i HALL

HIGH PERFORMANCE - PRICE PER TON

Dell\{er_ed

No Bid

E 143.75 |

Picked Up |

e
|

No Bid

E 12500

FOB LO LOCATION RK Hall: Greenwlle Asphalt Plant, 5651 SH 224, Greenvnlle Texas

STIFF OIL SAND OR COLD MIX

107.80 [

'; No Bid

Delivered Je
Picked Up | | |

91.80 |

|

, No Bid

221 CR 12530

FOB LOCATION & ADDRESS

Paris, Texas

T
|
|
T
|

I

ADDITIONAL NOTES FROM VENDOR

ik 15

DEMURRAGE:

N/A

'$120.00 PER HOUR |

AFTER:

.5 ( ONE HALF) HOUR

FREIGHT: = |

20 Ton Minimum |

== | = [

S I




TITUS COUNTY
Road Emulsions Bid # 2022-004
22-Aug-22

Dates of Public Notice in Local Newspaper
July 27, 2022 and August 3, 2022

Deadline for Bids Delivered to County Auditor's Office
8/15/2022 at 4:30 PM

Date Bids Opened
16-Aug-22

Bids Received, Date Received, Time Received, Method of Delivery
Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc

August 12, 2022 at 11:49 AM

Federal Express

Cleveland Asphalt Products, Inc
August 4, 2022 at 11:45 AM
Federal Express

P Squared Emulsion Plants, LLC
August 8,2022 at 8:55 AM

Hand Delivered E)GZ&/M %& 3

Contract Effective Dates
This bid is scheduled to be presented for approval in Commissioners' Court on August 22, 2022. 7"0’/\
Itis for a 1 year contract with option to renew for 2 additional year upon agreement by vendor

and County. Bid is initially effective September 1, 2022 upon approval by ARPA Grant Administrator, j, W
Traylor & Associates.

FOB LOCATION & ADDRESS FOR PICK UP )
Ergon Asphalt, 209 Robert Nance Road, Mt. Pleasant, Texas

Cleveland Asphalt, 100 Asphalt Lane, Shepherd, Texas

P Squared Emulsions, 516 South McLennan Loop, Elm Mott, Texas

ERGON  CLEVELAND P SQUARED

NON COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT: YES YES YES
LOBBYING CERTIFICATION: YES NO YES
CONFLICT OF INTEREST: YES YES YES
GENERAL LIABILITY INSURANCE: NO NO NO

Commissioners to determine the need for insurance when Titus County picks up a product.



TITUS COUNTY, ROAD OIL/EMULSIONS BID TABULATIONS, BID # 2022-004

EMULSIFIED ASPHALT, PER GALLON:

FOB

Emulsion, CSS-1:
Delivered

Picked Up

Emulsion, C55-1H:
Delivered
Picked Up

ERGON
ASPHALT

Mt Pleas

3.23
3.05

3.23
3.05

CLEVELAND
ASPHALT
Shepherd
3.12
$ 2.90
S 3.12
S 2.90

P2

EMULSIONS

ALTERNATE
Elm Mott
P251

$
$

$
$

2.96
2.68

Stabilizer
2.96
2.68

EMULSIFIED ASPHALT, PER GALLON:

ERGON
ASPHALT

FOB Mt Pleas
Emulsion, CRS-2:
S 3.23
S 3.05

Emulsion, CRS-2P:
S 3.63
S 3.45

P2 Emulsions also included a list of all P2 products and current pricing as of July 28, 2022. Prices are subject to change.
The list is attached to this bid tabulation.

OTHER CHARGES RELATED TO EMULSIFIED ASPHALT:

DEMURRAGE:
Per Hour
After # Hours

Minimum Gallons:

S 90.00 $ 80.00 $
2 2
5500 5000
Note 1 Note 2

80.00
2

5000
Note 3

CLEVELAND P2
ASPHALT EMULSIONS
ALTERNATE
Shepherd Elm Mott
CWE-2

S 312 $ 3.29
S 290 S 3.01

No Bid
No Bid

S 3.72
) 3.50

Note 1: Ergon: This bid is for full transport loads of 5,500 gallons. Freight is based on a full transport load
even if a full load of material is not ordered.

Note 2: Cleveland Asphalt: Freight options and size of load prices are based off of a minimum 5000 gallon load.
For smaller quantities, please call 800-334-0177.

Note 3: Smaller quantities available, subject to freight differential of $0.25 per gallon less than 5,000
gallons. Push Loads are $80.00 per hour.

PUMP & HOSE, PER LOAD:

$

90.00

None

See next page for additional other charges, please.

$

80.00



ENVIRONMENTAL FEES, ADD TO ABOVE PRICES:

Asphalt & Polymer Loads 0.4977 None None
Per Ton
Emulsion Loads 0.0015
Per Gallon
DIVERSION FEE: S 250.00 None None
Note 4

Note 4: Ergon: For equipment ordered, but not used, carrier may charge up to $ 400.
RETURN FREIGHT

CHARGES: Note 5 $ 1,100 Note6

Note 5: Ergon: Return freight charges are one-half of the outgoing tariff.

Note 6: P2 Emulsions: Return freight charges are subject to change from delivering freight line.

Bids for road materials, road oils, and road emulstions are on file in the auditor's office and are available
for review.

M\M ﬁ%@»ﬂmf g %MMKV R- 1993

Page 3

Barbara Shurbet, Titus County Auditor Date



P2 Emulsions

Service. Performance. Commitment.

Pricing Effective As Of July 28, 2022

Pricing subject to change with written notice.

[dm P sl Mol inni
caiesinagin - nicCK YicLinnis

Product Tanker FOB Plant Tanker FOB County Drum/Tote Plant
|P2 Stabilizer $2.68 $2.96 $2.90 |
[P2S1 $2.68 $2.96 $2.90 B
|P2 CWE-2 $3.01 $3.29 $3.23 |
(Chip Seal)

[P2 CWP $3.01 $3.29 $3.23 |
(Cold Weather Patch)

|P2 ROC $2.83 $3.10 $3.05 |
(Road Over Coat)

|P2 Rejuvenator $2.68 $2.96 $2.90 |
|P2 Prime Concentrate $1.97 $2.24 $2.19 |
[P2RTU $1.93 $2.20 $2.15 |

**All listed prices are per U.S. gallon

*Minimum Tanker Delivery:'S,OOO Gallons

**Delivery over 250 miles subject to additional charges
**Demurrage (trucking charge): First 2 hours free, $80.00 per hour thereafter

**Pump Charge (trucking charge): $80.00

**Push Charge (trucking charge): $80.00 per hour

**Return Loads (trucking charge): Subject to charge from delivering freight line

**Smaller Quantities Available, Subject to Freight Differential of $0.25/gal less than 5,000 gal

Containers available for smaller product amounts
“Tote" Containers (275 galions size each) cost $100.00 per container

"Drum” Containers (55 gallons size each) cost $35.00 per drum

Containers are re-usable and can be rinsed out, brought back and re-filled at customer discretion

Containers priced individually and sold only with orders for material

Thank you and we look forward to serving all your emulsion needs!

P2Emulsions.com 516 South McLennan Loop  Elm Mott, Texas 76640 254-829-0330



